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Emily Cooper <emily@smsfaustralia.com>

Anni - Can you do the two rollovers in the email chain for Junting & Qiuhua?
(AM) Not sure if need to say anything re 70K contribution?

SMSF property
Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> 20 January 2023 a
Reply-To: Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com>
To: Emily Cooper <emily@smsfaustralia.com>

Thanks Emily

Please do $70k concessional contribution for each person, $140,000 together.

Regards
Junyi

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Fri, 20 Jan 2023 at 14:20, Emily Cooper
<emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

No problem at all - I will lodge the requests and send through the details for your records.

Regards

Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia

 0481 001 746 

  emily@smsfaustralia.com

 

Efficiency is doing better what is already being done – Peter F Drucker

 

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed.
If you have received this email in error, please notify the system manager. This message contains confidential information and is intended only for
the individual named. If you are not the named addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender
immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient
you are notified that disclosing, copying, distributing or taking any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited.

On Fri, 20 Jan 2023 at 13:59, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:
Thanks Emily,

Our personal accountant believes as the Australia Super Account is not active for a period of time, Qiuhua's account maybe has been close. The balance was transferred out from
Super fund account with ATO now $2102.92. Are you able to request Qiuhua's fund transffered into SMSF account?  
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Regards
Junyi

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Fri, 20 Jan 2023 at 12:35, Emily Cooper
<emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

I shall see what I can do - the ATO usually records the information to the individual rather than the superannuation fund so I may not have any luck but it won't hurt to try!

Regards

Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia

 0481 001 746 

  emily@smsfaustralia.com

 

Efficiency is doing better what is already being done – Peter F Drucker
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On Fri, 20 Jan 2023 at 12:42, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:
Yes Emily

We can do $70k from each person. Please roll the Austrlian Super amount into SMSF

I could not find my mother in law's super. Are you able to see from your system? Our personal accountant could not locate Qiuhua's super on ATO website.

Regards
Junyi

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Fri, 20 Jan 2023 at 11:00, Emily Cooper
<emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

Hi Junyi,

I can only see the confirmation for Junting - did they send through one for Qiuhua?

Assuming hers is the same then there will be no problem with the $70,000 contributions to each of them and I can process on the SMSF side for you accordingly 😊

We can also request the Australian Super amount to be rolled into the SMSF for you.  Did you want me to lodge that request today for you?

Regards

Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia

 0481 001 746 

  emily@smsfaustralia.com
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This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed.
If you have received this email in error, please notify the system manager. This message contains confidential information and is intended only for
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On Thu, 19 Jan 2023 at 14:36, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:

Hi Emily

Please refer to attached photo

I have checked with personal accountant. This is what accountant suggests to make $70k concessional contribution from each person, $140,000k together.  Are yo
to arrange this? 

Are you able to merge Australian super fund balance into SMSF?
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Regards
Junyi

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Thu, 19 Jan 2023 at 9:34, Emily Cooper
<emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

Hi Junyi,

They will need to check with their personal tax accountant. That accountant can download a report from the ATO portal for them that specifies exactly how muc
concessional and non concessional they will be able to put into super and will also know they personal situation in more detail in case it will affect anything else
they have going on.

We can set it up to then track the details in our system but just need that ATO report so we can confirm the correct amounts.

Regards

Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia

 0481 001 746 

  emily@smsfaustralia.com

 

Efficiency is doing better what is already being done – Peter F Drucker
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On Wed, 18 Jan 2023 at 11:57, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:
Hi Emily

My last financial year income is a bit high. My parents in law have not made any concessional contribution in the past. Can they
claim maximum amount of concessional contribution including the amount unused during the previous financial years? Can they
$75,000 concessional super contribution from each person, $150,000 together?

Regards
Junyi

On Tuesday, 10 January 2023, 03:56:21 pm AEST, Emily Cooper <emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

No problem - as soon as you confirm the details we should be able to finalise the SMSF for you 😊

Regards

Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia

 0481 001 746 

  emily@smsfaustralia.com

 

Efficiency is doing better what is already being done – Peter F Drucker
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On Tue, 10 Jan 2023 at 15:08, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:
Thanks Emily

I will comfirm with my accountant after confirming family trust distribution

Regards
Junyi

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Tue, 10 Jan 2023 at 14:22, Emily Cooper
<emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

Hi Junyi,

You can claim $27,500 each ($55,000 as a couple) as a personal deduction - less any employer contributions (which it doesn't look like you have).  You
may be able to claim more depending on what you have used in previous years - your personal accountant will be able to confirm this from the ATO.

There is also an non-concessional contribution cap of $110,000 each per year - you can't claim this one as a tax deduction but you also won't pay tax o
this type.

I think the best strategy will be for your personal account to confirm the amount you will need to claim as a tax deduction based on the distributions from
your family trust.  I can then record everything to match and prepare the paperwork on the SMSF side for you.

Regards

Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia

 0481 001 746 

  emily@smsfaustralia.com
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On Mon, 9 Jan 2023 at 16:59, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:
Hi Emily

Please see reply below in red 

On Monday, 9 January 2023, 03:36:17 pm AEST, Emily Cooper <emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

HI Junyi,

I was just typing out an email to you as this came in!  Must be reading my mind!

We have finished working through everything and I just need you to confirm the following for me:

1. I have documents for the Establishment Fee and the Property deposit but can't see where these were paid from the SMSF bank account.  We
these paid from a personal account?  If so, would you like me to record these as a contribution to the Fund?    These fund came from a perso
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account, and transferred to a SMSF bank account to make the property purchase. I have attached a copy of SMSF statement in this email. Bu
fund is originally from personal account as contribution

1. There are the following contributions I just need to confirm who they are for:
15/02/2022 $1,000.00 Non Concessional
22/02/2022 $40,000.00 Non Concessional
23/02/2022 $38,000.00 Non Concessional
24/02/2022 $30,000.00 Non Concessional
25/02/2022 $40,000.00 Non Concessional
28/02/2022 $3,000.00 Goldenwater Foun, Concessional
28/02/2022 $20,000.00 Non Concessional
28/02/2022 $40,000.00 Non Concessional
01/03/2022 $40,000.00 Concessional
02/03/2022 $40,000.00 Super Contributions
10/03/2022 $211.83 CBA Mortimer (personal to Junting He?)  This is from solicitor account for purchase refund du
extra payment during settlement

2. Are the concessional contributions employer contributions or will these be claimed as a personal tax deduction?

Once confirmed I will be able to get everything finalised for you.    Claim as personal tax deduction. How much concessional contribution can we clai
the most for a couple at our age? 

28/02/2022 $3,000.00 Goldenwater Foun, Concessional
01/03/2022 $40,000.00 Concessional
02/03/2022 $40,000.00 Super Contributions  (not sure claim as concessional or non concessional, we may need to talk to our accountant base on th
income distributed family trust)

Let me know if you have any questions.

Regards

Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia

 0481 001 746 

  emily@smsfaustralia.com
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On Mon, 9 Jan 2023 at 15:38, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:

Hi Emily,

Any update on the progess?

Regards
Junyi

On Thursday, 24 November 2022, 12:46:53 pm AEST, Emily Cooper <emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

Hi Junyi,

Still working through it all at the moment - I'm aiming to have it all done for you in the next couple of weeks.

Regards

Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia
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 0481 001 746 

  emily@smsfaustralia.com
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On Wed, 23 Nov 2022 at 12:51, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:
Hi Emily

Have we lodged the tax claim for my property in caboolture?

Regards
Junyi

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Tue, 8 Nov 2022 at 9:08, Emily Cooper
<emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

Hi Junyi,

You will need to be still classed as a resident to have an SMSF, but you are able to be temporarily overseas for up to two years.

As long as you meet these requirements, you are still able to arrange the sale of the property without physically being in the country 😊

Regards

Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia

 0481 001 746 

  emily@smsfaustralia.com
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On Mon, 7 Nov 2022 at 20:05, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:
Thanks Emily

If I am going to overseas for a year, could I still keep the property under SMSF? Or it only requires owner to b
Australia when sell the property under SMSF?

Regards
Junyi

mailto:emily@smsfaustralia.com
mailto:lujunyi2000@yahoo.com
https://go.onelink.me/107872968?pid=InProduct&c=Global_Internal_YGrowth_AndroidEmailSig__AndroidUsers&af_wl=ym&af_sub1=Internal&af_sub2=Global_YGrowth&af_sub3=EmailSignature
mailto:emily@smsfaustralia.com
mailto:emily@smsfaustralia.com
mailto:lujunyi2000@yahoo.com


02/02/2023, 16:04 SMSF Australia Mail - SMSF property

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=0e8ca0cc51&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1755513946310784596&simpl=msg-f%3A175551… 8/15

On Monday, 7 November 2022, 09:38:29 am AEST, Emily Cooper <emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

Hi Junyi,

As long as the property is not under an LRBA structure (which you don't have) there is no reason you can't subdivide.

Just ensure that the SMSF pays all the expenses and everything is at arm's length as per the usual compliance requirements.  Aside fr
that you should have no issues 😊

Let me know if you need any assistance with it.

Regards

Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia

 0481 001 746 

  emily@smsfaustralia.com
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On Sun, 6 Nov 2022 at 15:35, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:
Hi Emily

Our property under the SMSF has the potential to split the land, is it compliant to SMSF legislation to do lan
subdivision? There is no mortgage on this property.

Regards
Junyi  

On Thursday, 20 October 2022, 09:19:14 am AEST, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:

Great, Emily

Thanks
Junyi

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Thu, 20 Oct 2022 at 9:15, Emily Cooper
<emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

Hi Junyi,

You are now on our lodgement list which means you should now have until 28 February 2023 to finalise the lodgement 😊

Regards

Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia

 0481 001 746 

  emily@smsfaustralia.com
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On Wed, 19 Oct 2022 at 16:48, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:
Hi Emily

Have we lodged the notification to ATO? I received a msg before saying lodgment needs to be done by
end of Octorber.

Regards
Junyi

On Friday, 14 October 2022, 08:59:44 am AEST, Emily Cooper <emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

Hi Junyi, 

The ASIC bills come to us as your ASIC agent and we check them, make sure they are correct, and pass them onto you.

And it costs you absolutely nothing extra as part of our annual service fee 😊

Regards

Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia

 0481 001 746 

  emily@smsfaustralia.com
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On Thu, 13 Oct 2022 at 18:04, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:
Hi Emily

Regarding the company ASIC annual fee, will this be emailed or posted to me directly for the future
payment? How much do you charge if ASIC renewal bill emailed to you directly?

Regards
Junyi 

On Thursday, 13 October 2022, 03:32:06 pm AEST, Emily Cooper <emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

At the moment no, but I will let you know if I come across anything 😊

Regards

Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia
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On Thu, 13 Oct 2022 at 15:45, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:
All good, do you need anything else?

Regards
Junyi

On Thursday, 13 October 2022, 01:31:35 pm AEST, Emily Cooper <emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

Thanks Junyi! It was hiding from me 😂

I have the docs now.

Regards

Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia

 0481 001 746 

  emily@smsfaustralia.com
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On Thu, 13 Oct 2022 at 13:52, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:
Hi Emily,

Did you see these links in the previous email regarding the deed? They are very big, so I have to upload to google drive
and email you the link
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Regards
Junyi

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Thu, 13 Oct 2022 at 13:04, Emily Cooper
<emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

Hi Junyi,

Those were all documents relating to the property, but we actually need the SMSF deed - you would have received
documentation for signature upon set up.

We also need details of your SMSF Trustee company as well (He & Yan SMSF Pty Ltd).

Thanks.

Regards

Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia

 0481 001 746 

  emily@smsfaustralia.com

 

Efficiency is doing better what is already being done – Peter F Drucker
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On Thu, 13 Oct 2022 at 10:48, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:
Hi Emily,

Is this what you are after? Please refer to email below sent last month.

Regards
Junyi

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

----- Forwarded message -----
From: "Lu Junyi" <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com>
To: "Emily Cooper" <emily@smsfaustralia.com>
Cc:
Sent: Fri, 23 Sep 2022 at 20:55
Subject: Re: SMSF property
Hi Emily,

As requested, please see the attached documents. If you need anything else, please let m
know.

Refer to bank statement, all the transactions on page 2 and page 3 are super contribution

11 Mar 2022 11 Mar 2022 Cash Management Account
Direct Credit from CBA ,
Refund 45 Mortimer
Deposit $1,538.09   (refund from solicitor due to surplus fund )

10 Mar 2022 10 Mar 2022 Cash Management Account
Direct Credit from CBA , 49
Mortimer
Deposit $211.83  (Super self contribution)

02 Mar 2022 02 Mar 2022 Cash Management Account
Payment to Tenet Legal - 45 mortimer

https://go.onelink.me/107872968?pid=InProduct&c=Global_Internal_YGrowth_AndroidEmailSig__AndroidUsers&af_wl=ym&af_sub1=Internal&af_sub2=Global_YGrowth&af_sub3=EmailSignature
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street
Payment -$331,189.00  ( Fund required from solicitor for settlement )

HEJU002 0121 Tdeed(s).pdf

HEJU002 0121 Tdeed(s).pdf

HEJU002 0121 ISD-SF(s).pdf

HEJU002 0121 ISD-SF(s).pdf

HEJU001 0121 Constitution(s).pdf

HEJU001 0121 Constitution(s).pdf

https://drive.google.com/file/d/1_zhwwYGXRrCeIaGZCccofGMlUAbWkRuU/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1_zhwwYGXRrCeIaGZCccofGMlUAbWkRuU/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1_zSmlChdone91LCvFvxwu245FPTmIR0_/view?usp=sharing
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1_zSmlChdone91LCvFvxwu245FPTmIR0_/view?usp=sharing
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Regards
Junyi
0433 135 021
On Thursday, 15 September 2022, 08:45:57 pm AEST, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:

Hi Emily

I will try get everything back to you next week.

Regards
Junyi

On Monday, 12 September 2022, 08:31:36 am AEST, Emily Cooper <emily@smsfaustralia.com> wrote:

Hi Junyi,

All still the same as the conversation you had on Google with the team yesterday 😊 

If you want to go ahead we just need the documents discussed and the attached engagement letter signed
and returned.

Regards
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Emily Cooper

SMSF Accountant | SMSF Australia

 0481 001 746 

  emily@smsfaustralia.com
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On Sun, 11 Sept 2022 at 12:15, Lu Junyi <lujunyi2000@yahoo.com> wrote:
Hi Emily,

I have a property under SMSF, no mortgage. I want to do tax lodgement for this property. Can you please
advise the documents you need, as well as fees for accountant, auditor and software costs.

Thanks
Junyi

4 attachments
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