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Brenda Wishey

From: Mark Bromback | Snelleman Tom <M.Bromback@SnellemanTom.com.au>
Sent: Thursday, 9 March 2023 9:20 AM
To: Brenda Wishey
Subject: FW: THE ECHELON SUPERANNUATION FUND - Bidco Payment Query

Hi Brenda 
 
As Chris advises it was the post settlement adjustment.  
 
It was processed via the Acis bank account as Bidco does not have a bank account. 
 
Cheers 
 

Mark Bromback
 

 

 

Location: Level 3 Mosaic Offices, 826 Ann St, Fortitude Valley 4006 | Postal: PO Box 360, Fortitude Valley Qld 4006
P 07 3871 0081 | E M.Bromback@SnellemanTom.com.au | W www.snellemantom.com.au 
 

DISCLAIMER 
Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards Legislation* (*other than for the acts or omissions of financial 
services licensees). The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain 
confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in reliance 
upon, this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you received this in error, please 
contact the sender and delete the material from any computer. 
 

 

From: Chris Twible <chris@acis.net.au>  
Sent: Thursday, 9 March 2023 9:03 AM 
To: Mark Bromback | Snelleman Tom <M.Bromback@SnellemanTom.com.au> 
Subject: RE: THE ECHELON SUPERANNUATION FUND - Bidco Payment Query 
 
Hi Mark, 
 
Bidco didn’t have a bank so it was paid into Acis (subsidiary of Bidco). Bidco directed it to be paid into the Acis 
bank account. 
 
It was just a completion adjustment under the SPA following the completion accounts. 
 
 
 
 

Regards 

Chris Twible  
CFO  

Brenda Wishey

wishey@iinet.net.au
Highlight
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M 0422 745 668  
P 1800 773 477  
acis.net.au  

   

The contents of this email is subject to our Terms and Conditions which apply immediately upon receipt by you.  

   

 
From: Mark Bromback | Snelleman Tom <M.Bromback@SnellemanTom.com.au>  
Sent: Thursday, 9 March 2023 8:51 AM 
To: Chris Twible <chris@acis.net.au> 
Subject: FW: THE ECHELON SUPERANNUATION FUND - Bidco Payment Query 
 
Hi Chris 
 
Sorry to trouble you but I don’t hold anything more formal. 
 
Can you assist? 
 
Cheers 
 

Mark Bromback
 

 

 

Location: Level 3 Mosaic Offices, 826 Ann St, Fortitude Valley 4006 | Postal: PO Box 360, Fortitude Valley Qld 4006
P 07 3871 0081 | E M.Bromback@SnellemanTom.com.au | W www.snellemantom.com.au 
 

DISCLAIMER 
Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards Legislation* (*other than for the acts or omissions of financial 
services licensees). The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain 
confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in reliance 
upon, this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you received this in error, please 
contact the sender and delete the material from any computer. 
 

 

From: Acis Finance <finance@acis.net.au>  
Sent: Thursday, 9 March 2023 8:31 AM 
To: Mark Bromback | Snelleman Tom <M.Bromback@SnellemanTom.com.au> 
Subject: FW: THE ECHELON SUPERANNUATION FUND - Bidco Payment Query 
 
Morning Mark, 
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FYI 
 
 

Regards 

Thomas Campbell  
Financial Assistant  

P 1800 773 477  
acis.net.au  

   

The contents of this email is subject to our Terms and Conditions which apply immediately upon receipt by you.  

 

 
  

From: Brenda Wishey <BrendaW@virtusuper.com.au>  
Sent: Wednesday, 8 March 2023 6:39 PM 
To: Mark Bromback <markb@acis.net.au> 
Subject: THE ECHELON SUPERANNUATION FUND - Bidco Payment Query 
 
Hi Mark 
 
Can you shed any light on why this amount was paid from the SMSF to Bidco? 
 
Do you have anything more formal than an email that can confirm this was paid to Bidco and not to ACIS? 
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Regards 
Brenda 

 

Brenda Wishey 
Senior Accountant
 

VIRTU  | self managed super specialists
  

1454 Logan Road, Mount Gravatt Q 4122
 
 

  07 3349 1452 
 

  PO BOX 83 Mount Gravatt Q 4122
 

  www.virtusuper.com.au
    

 

 
Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards legislation  
Virtu Super Pty Ltd ACN 134 260 512  
 
Please note that collection, use and storage of all information held by the Virtu Super is governed by our Privacy Policy.  
This email and any attachment are confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify Virtu Super by reply email and delete this email.  
Please note that you must not access or use this email or any information in it. Virtu Super accepts no liability for viruses in this email or in any attachment to it. 
 


