Brenda Wishey

From: Bradley Hoffman <Brad.hoffman@prosuper.com.au>
Sent: Friday, 4 February 2022 2:10 PM

To: Brenda Wishey; Elizabeth Meiklejohn

Subject: Re: The Manz Superannuation Fund - $8,800 Query
Hi Brenda

The fee to Joe from Virtu is straight to the super fund and is in addition to Brad's fee. Thereis a long
history there. Basically, Brad has been working with Joe to firstly get AET removed as trustee of the fund
as a Small APRA Fund when we were both at Crowe Horwath, and subsequently to try and get Joe to bring
the fund up to date for a long time in 2021. Brad has not billed Joe for any of that until the $8K

invoice. Has been like pulling teeth!

Kind regards

Brad Hoffman

Managing Director
Pro-Super Australia Pty Ltd
Freecall: 1800 641 146
Freefax: 1800 024 831

WWW.prosuper.com.au

GPO Box 26
Brisbane QLD 4001

This e-mail and any attachments may be confidential. You must not disclose or use the information contained in this e-mail if you are not the
intended recipient. If you have received this e-mail in error, please notify us immediately and delete the e-mail and all copies. Pro-Super does not
guarantee that this e-mail is virus or error free. The attached files are provided and may only be used on the basis that the user assumes all
responsibility for any loss, damage or consequence resulting directly or indirectly from the use of the attached files, whether caused by the
negligence of the sender or not. Pro-Super is not responsible for any changes made to a document other than those made by Pro-Super, or for the
effect of any changes (not made by Pro-Super) on a document's meaning. The content and opinions in non-business e-mail are not necessarily
those of Pro-Super.

From: Brenda Wishey <BrendaW@virtusuper.com.au>

Sent: Friday, 4 February 2022 1:49 PM

To: Bradley Hoffman <Brad.hoffman@prosuper.com.au>; Elizabeth Meiklejohn <ElizabethM@virtusuper.com.au>
Subject: The Manz Superannuation Fund - $8,800 Query

Hi Brad & Liz



Before | go to Brad Corby, just wanting to know if either of you are aware of Brad Corby being paid $8,800 to get the
fund up to date?

| can see that is exactly what we quoted to get the years up to 2021 up to date, but we have not issued an invoice.
Trying to get an understanding as to whether we will be charging BC or if our quote is on top of what BC charged?
| will also need to ask for a copy of invoice from BC if the SMSF has paid him directly.

Regards
Brenda

Brenda Wishey
Senior Accountant
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Please note that collection, use and storage of all information held by the Virtu Super is governed by our Privacy Policy.
This email and any attachment are confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify Virtu Super by reply email and delete this email.
Please note that you must not access or use this email or any information in it. Virtu Super accepts no liability for viruses in this email or in any attachment to it.



