Chaitra Ramesh

From: Elizabeth Meiklejohn

Sent: Thursday, 15 June 2023 11:15 AM

To: Chaitra Ramesh

Subject: FW: Hyslop Superannuation Fund - interim
Hi Chai

See below.

Can you please match up?

Min pension and then lump sum — copy last year.
Save down this email as F1 workpaper

Match up the term deposit and interest.

Thanks

Liz
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From: Bronwynne Hyslop <bjh@azapak.com.au>

Sent: Thursday, June 15, 2023 11:14 AM

To: Elizabeth Meiklejohn <ElizabethM@virtusuper.com.au>
Subject: RE: Hyslop Superannuation Fund - interim

Hello Liz

The majority of these are pension phase withdrawals. The $10000 withdrawal on 24/10 and deposit on 24/5 and the
amount of $174.24 are a term deposit /repayment and the associated interest for that amount

Kind regards Bronwynne



From: Elizabeth Meiklejohn <ElizabethM@virtusuper.com.au>

Sent: Wednesday, June 14, 2023 11:52 AM

To: Bronwynne Hyslop <bjh@azapak.com.au>

Subject: Hyslop Superannuation Fund - interim

Hi Bronwynne

We are currently doing some interim work on your Super Fund. Would you be able to please advise what the below

transactions relate to?
7/08/2022 55,000.00
1/09/2022 5,000.00
24/10/2022 10,000.00

2/11/2022 430.00
20/11/2022 1,875.00
5/12/2022 220.00
22/12/2022 16,704.00
3/01/2023 220.00

3/01/2023 25,000.00
31/01/2023 4,000.00
3/05/2023 330.00
24/05/2023
24/05/2023

Thanks for your help.
Kind regards

Liz

PAY ANYONE TO Cindy Hyslop 923100 080742812

PAY ANYONE TO Cindy Hyslop 923100 080742812
WITHDRAWAL TFR to 23357451

PAY ANYONE TO Cindy Hyslop 923100 080742812

PAY ANYONE TO Impact Energy Pty Ltd 064184 011021170
PAY ANYONE TO Cindy Hyslop 923100 080742812

PAY ANYONE TO Impact Energy Pty Ltd 064184 011021170
PAY ANYONE TO Cindy Hyslop 923100 080742812

PAY ANYONE TO Cindy Hyslop 923100 080742812

PAY ANYONE TO My Sparky Mate 062692 049290906

PAY ANYONE TO Cindy Hyslop 923100 080742812

174.24 TFR: FROM TIME A/C TO TRAN A/C (deposit)
10,000.00 TFR: FROM TIME A/C TO TRAN A/C (deposit)
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