
Meeting on Tuesday 22nd November 2022 at 1pm

Present:

Rachel Green Luther of Virtu

Joe Dias

Discussed:

- Joe will keep the ANZ Bank account with $0.36. Has no transactions in 22FY and wants to keep for
history
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No Transactions in 2020-2021.
Closing Balance same as 2019-20: $0.36
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Rachel Green-Luther

From: Asfran <asfran@asfran.com.au>

Sent: Thursday, November 7, 2019 12:33 PM

To: Rachel Green-Luther

Subject: RE: CNS Automation Super Fund - 2018/2019FY Missing Information

Hi Rachel, 

 

With regard to the 1. Nothing has changed since 2013/14 and ANZ do not have the statements online at all. 

Think this is because it is only $ 0 .36. 

 

Best Regards 

 

 

Asfran pty ltd                                               Unit 4, 72 Riverside Place 

Tel:    +61 7 38 99 51 00                                   Morningside, Queensland 4170 

Mob: 0421 528 803                                                       AUSTRALIA 

Email: j_dias@asfran.com.au                              www.asfran.com.au 

 

 
 

From: Rachel Green-Luther <RachelG@virtusuper.com.au>  

Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2019 11:56 AM 

To: Joe Dias <j_dias@asfran.com.au>; Asfran Email <asfran@asfran.com.au> 

Cc: Brad Hoffman <BradleyH@virtusuper.com.au> 

Subject: RE: CNS Automation Super Fund - 2018/2019FY Missing Information 

 

Hi Joe and Annette,  
 
Just a reminder to please provide the following for the super fund’s 2018/2019 financial accounts and tax 
return: 
 

1. Bank statements or an internet transaction listing for ANZ Etrade old account (4961-58222) for the 
period 1 July 2018 to 30 June 2019 (or date of closure if applicable). 

 
2. For 4/72 Riverside Place, Morningside: 

a. The current lease agreement between the Super Fund and Asfran Pty Ltd; and  
b. Market rental appraisal to confirm rent is at market rates 

I know when we last spoke, you were working on this.  
 

3. Advise what the 24/09/2018 $5,000 withdrawal narrated as “TRANSFER 093786 TO 
014253291510632”, paid from ANZ V2 bank account, was for? 

 
Also, now that the new property has been settled, could you please provide: 

• Signed and dated purchase contract; 
• Settlement Statement; 
• Any Legal invoices; 
• Any related expense invoices;  
• Signed copy of any Lease agreements in place (if any);  
• If rented to a related party, market rental appraisal to confirm rent is at market rates.  
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RGL spoke to Joe Dias on 13 May 2021 - Joe confirmed:
	- Balance is still $0.36
	- Account is still open
	- Account has had no transctions from 1 July 2019 to 30 June 2020.
	- he is keeping it as it was connected to teh SMSF previous Share 		portfolio. 

wishey@iinet.net.au
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