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Rachel Green-Luther

From: Fiona Downham <fiona@xcessbusinessservices.com.au>
Sent: Monday, 28 November 2022 12:26 PM
To: Chris Clarke; Rachel Green-Luther
Cc: mariela.astorga@live.com.au; Chaitra Ramesh
Subject: RE: Astorga Super Fund - 2021/2022 information request
Attachments: Invoice INV-1379.pdf; Invoice INV-1294.pdf; Invoice INV-1293.pdf

Hi Rachel and Chaitra, 
 

 
Thanks, 
 
Kind regards, 
 
 
Fiona Downham 
Xcess Business Services 
Mobile: 0435 992377 
 

      
 
This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they 
are addressed. If you have received this email in error please notify the system manager. This message contains confidential 
information and is intended only for the individual named. If you are not the named addressee you should not disseminate, 
distribute or copy this e-mail.  
Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. 
If you are not the intended recipient you are notified that disclosing, copying, distributing or taking any action in reliance on the 
contents of this information is strictly prohibited. 
 

From: Chris Clarke <christopher.t.clarke@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 28 November 2022 12:10 PM 
To: Rachel Green-Luther <RachelG@virtusuper.com.au> 
Cc: mariela.astorga@live.com.au; Chaitra Ramesh <ChaitraR@virtusuper.com.au>; Fiona Downham 
<fiona@xcessbusinessservices.com.au> 
Subject: Re: Astorga Super Fund - 2021/2022 information request 
 
Hi Rachel and Chaitra 
 
I have copied Fiona on this as she is helping out with the bookkeeping for more of our entities including ASF. Perhaps 
you can provide access for her to the accounting system? 



2

 
In response:  
 
1. all attached except the loan account - NAB IB isn't being friendly right now, so I will try again later 
 
2. Request from Darren - I copied you on the email 

3. For the Brazilian property, advise: 
The market value at 30 June 2022? Previously had AU$50,000. Recent discussion with Rachel, we agreed to keep this 
the same. Currently the initial investment is being crystalised and being rolled into another development with the same 
investment group. 
 
In the coming months the profit will be crystalised but until this happens we will see :) 
 
Any income has been paid during 2021/2022 FY? 
Nil 
 
Any updates on the investment? 
Above 
 
Any recent financial statements and tax returns? 
Nil 
 
Any recent documentation on the investment? 
No further than the initial 
 
 
4. Can you advise which account this was from? 
 
 
Thanks 
 
Chris 
 
 
 
On Tue, 23 Aug 2022 at 13:39, Rachel Green-Luther <RachelG@virtusuper.com.au> wrote: 

Hi Chris & Mariela,  

  

Hope you are both well.  

  

May I introduce Chaitra Ramesh (cc’d in this email), she will be helping me out with the super funds.   

  

When you are ready to start the super fund’s Financial Accounts and Tax Return, please provide: 
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1. For the Brazilian property, advise: 
a. The market value at 30 June 2021? Previously had AU$50,000. 

 
No change - still under construction 

b. Any income has been paid during 2020/2021 FY? 
 
Nil 

c. Any updates on the investment? 
 
No further - COVID impacted so delays in construction 

d. Any recent financial statements and tax returns? 
 
NA 

e. Any recent documentation on the investment? 
 
If needed I can ask - please advise 

  

  

 

 

Many thanks 

 

Chris 

 

 

 

On Tue, 3 May 2022 at 15:04, Rachel Green-Luther <RachelG@virtusuper.com.au> wrote: 
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Rachel Green-Luther

From: Chris Clarke <christopher.t.clarke@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 7, 2021 10:46 AM

To: Rachel Green-Luther

Cc: Mariela Astorga; accounts@viveogroup.com

Subject: Fwd: Astorga Super Fund - 2019/2020 Information request

Attachments: CLA08S - Side Letter Agreement (Related Party Tenant).docx; 6419-20190930-

statement.pdf; 31 July 2019 Statement.pdf; 30 June 2019 Statement.pdf; 31 August 

2019 Statement.pdf; 7395-20191231-statement.pdf; 30 September 2019 

Statement.pdf; 31 October 2019 Statement.pdf; 30 November 2019 Statement.pdf; 

31 December 2019 Statement.pdf; 31 January 2020 Statement.pdf; 29 February 2020 

Statement.pdf; 31 March 2020 Statement.pdf; 30 April 2020 Statement.pdf; 31 May 

2020 Statement.pdf; 30 June 2020 Statement.pdf; 31 July 2020 Statement.pdf; 30 

September 2020 Statement.pdf; 31 August 2020 Statement.pdf; 31 October 2020 

Statement.pdf; 30 November 2020 Statement.pdf; 31 December 2020 Statement.pdf; 

28 February 2021 Statement.pdf; 31 January 2021 Statement.pdf; 01 March 2021 

Statement.pdf; 31 March 2021 Statement.pdf; 01 December 2020 Statement.pdf; 01 

September 2020 Statement.pdf; 01 June 2020 Statement.pdf; 01 September 2019 

Statement.pdf; 01 June 2019 Statement.pdf; 01 December 2019 Statement.pdf; 01 

March 2020 Statement.pdf; Ltr - Rental Relief - ASF - Primivo.jpg

Hi Rachel 

 

I have copied Fiona on this email as I am hoping she can help with some information. 

 

Fiona, can you confirm what the duration of the rental relief for Primivo was? 

 

Rachel, please see answers below: 

 

Thanks 

 

Chris 

 

 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 

From: Rachel Green-Luther <RachelG@virtusuper.com.au> 

Date: Wed, 17 Mar 2021 at 15:22 

Subject: Astorga Super Fund - 2019/2020 Information request 

To: Chris Clarke <christopher.t.clarke@gmail.com>, mariela.astorga@live.com.au <mariela.astorga@live.com.au> 

 

Hi Chris and Mariela,  

  

Hope you well and having a smashing week.  

  

Just a reminder that your super fund’s 2019/2020 tax return due in 2 months.   
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When you are ready to start the super fund’s 2019/2020 Financial Accounts and Tax Return, please 
provide: 

  

3. For the Brazilian property, advise: 
a. The market value at 30 June 2020? Previously had AU$50,000. 
b. Any income has been paid during 2019/2020 FY? 

c. Any updates on the investment? 

 

THIS PROERTY HAS NOT CHANGED IN NET VALUE 
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Rachel Green-Luther

From: Chris Clarke <christopher.t.clarke@gmail.com>

Sent: Sunday, February 10, 2019 1:55 PM

To: Rachel Green-Luther

Cc: mariela.astorga@live.com.au; Brad Hoffman

Subject: Re: Astorga Super Fund - 2018FY Quote and Queries

Hi Rachel 

 

All going well thanks. I had knee surgery last week and hope to be a bot more mobile by the end of the week. How is 

Thursday morning around 10am? 

 

In answer to your questions: 

1. Brazil property is the same value with no income paid 

2. Yes, I believe we provided personal guarantees 

3. Loan is 15 years 

Thanks 

 

Chris 

 

 

On Mon, 4 Feb 2019 at 15:59, Rachel Green-Luther <RachelG@virtusuper.com.au> wrote: 

Hi Chris and Mariela,  

  

How was the kids first week at school? Hope you are all settling in well.  

  

Did you have a preferred time next week that you would like to come in? Basically anytime in the morning 
is fine.  

  

We estimate the fee to complete the super fund 2017/18 financial statements and tax return to be 
$4,180.00 (GST inclusive).  

  

If you are happy to proceed, could you please: 

  

1. Provide the following for the Brazilian property: 
a. Advise the market value of the Brazilian investment is at 30/06/2018? Previously had 

AU$50,000.00; and 

b. Advise if any income has been paid during the 2017/2018 FY. 

  

admin
Typewritten text
RGL spoke to Chris Clarke on the phone
 on 12/03/2020.
He advised that the Brazilian investment
 market value is still AUS$50,000 and no
 income has been received. 

admin
Highlight



2

2. Advise if you and Mariela had to provide the bank’s with personal guarantees to get the super fund 
loan? 

  

3. Advise when the NAB loan has to be repaid by? I’m interested to know how long the loan’s term is.   

  

If you have any questions or concerns, please feel free to contact myself or Brad.   

  

Kind regards,  

  

  

Rachel Green-Luther CPA
 

Accountant 
 

   

 

   

 

 
Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards legislation  
Virtu Super Pty Ltd ACN 134 260 512

 

Please note that collection, use and storage of all information held by the Virtu Super is governed by our Privacy Policy. This email and any 
attachment are confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify Virtu Super by reply email and delete this email. Please note that you 
must not access or use this email or any information in it. Virtu Super accepts no liability for viruses in this email or in any attachment to it. 
  

 

 

 

--  

 

Chris Clarke B.Pharm MPS MACP 

+61 (0) 407 670912 

PO Box 2529 

Ascot 

Queensland 4007 

Australia 
  
THINK.. before you print! 
**************** Confidentiality and Privilege Notice ******************* 

This e-mail is intended only to be read or used by the addressee. It is confidential and may contain legally privileged information. If you are not the addressee indicated in 

this message (or responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone, and you should destroy this message and 

kindly notify the sender by reply e-mail. Confidentiality and legal privilege are not waived or lost by reason of mistaken delivery to you.   

  



From: Chris Clarke
To: Rachel Green
Subject: Re: Astorga Super Fund - Information required 2015 FY
Date: Thursday, 20 August 2015 4:00:52 AM

Hi Rachel

Thanks for the email.

In relation to the list, the only property the fund has is the 50k in Brazil which is part of a
 development. You have the details of this. There was no formal valuation on the 30th
 June.

The rest is cash and shares which relate to the BOQ savings account and Wilsons HTM. I
 think you have access to these? If not, I will need to update the income on the attached
 spreadsheet (Astorga Super Fund tab).

Otherwise the expenses, aside from the insurance is included on the attached spreadsheet.

I think you have the details of the insurance, if not, let em know and I will arrange what
 you need.

Thanks

Chris

​

 Income and Expenses 12_13_14_15
​

On 6 August 2015 at 19:30, Rachel Green <rachelg@virtusuper.com.au> wrote:

Good Morning Chris,

 

RE:     INFORMATION REQUIREMENTS FOR 2014/15 FINANCIAL YEAR

 

As the 2014/15 financial year has come to an end, I now provide you with a list of information
 required, in order to assist in the collation of information for the preparation of these Accounts. The
 enclosed ‘Checklist’ details the information that we will require to prepare the Superannuation Fund’s
 Financial Statements.

 

For efficiency purposes, we cannot commence work on the Financial Statements until all items on the
 list have been received.

 

Please review the attached ‘Checklist’ and forward us the applicable information at your convenience. 

mailto:christopher.t.clarke@gmail.com
mailto:rachelg@virtusuper.com.au
https://docs.google.com/spreadsheets/d/1cXX1j7YpilqQY5dgxMmH1rC2X0w-tZshahMLK-ISC_A/edit?usp=drive_web
https://docs.google.com/spreadsheets/d/1cXX1j7YpilqQY5dgxMmH1rC2X0w-tZshahMLK-ISC_A/edit?usp=drive_web
mailto:rachelg@virtusuper.com.au
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Client: Astorga Superannuation Fund W/P: A2

Index Initials Date

ITEMS CARRIED FORWARD Prep by: RG 12-Feb-15

As at: 30-Jun-14 Rev by: 

Item Date
Meeting, 

Phone, Other

Action 

To Do

Cleared 

Date/Init

1 12-02-15 Other

The limited partnership then invests in:                                   

R$85,146 (85,146 shares in VCREP-4 LLC Partnership) + 

R$21,287 (Promissory Note in Longview Consultoria e 

Participacoes Ltda).

None of the parties in the partnership are related.

Purchased by the super fund but only indicate Mariela name on the 

agreement. The super fund will receive all returns on the 

investment.

The limited partnership is involved with a completion of Villas "Villas 

do Campeche" property development.

Details of Communication or Matter

Brazilian Limited Partnership Investment

Purchased on 28/11/2013.

Total investment of Brazilian Real R$106,433 Limited Partnership 

which equates to AUS$50,000.

Superannuation Workpapers 2014 - CLA08S

Printed 12/02/2015 A2 Items forward - Page 1
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