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Brenda Wishey

From: Elizabeth Meiklejohn
Sent: Friday, 25 June 2021 9:03 AM
To: Brenda Wishey
Subject: FW: Transfer to Super fund
Attachments: RCS (004).pdf

 
 
 

Elizabeth Meiklejohn SSA CA
 

Senior Associate 
  

 

Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards legislation 

Virtu Super Pty Ltd ACN 134 260 512  
 
 
Please note that collection, use and storage of all information held by the Virtu Super is governed by our Privacy Policy. This email and any attachment 
are confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify Virtu Super by reply email and delete this email. Please note that you must not 
access or use this email or any information in it. Virtu Super accepts no liability for viruses in this email or in any attachment to it. 

 

From: Neil Muller <neil@duralloy.com.au>  
Sent: Wednesday, 23 June 2021 12:30 PM 
To: Elizabeth Meiklejohn <ElizabethM@virtusuper.com.au> 
Subject: FW: Transfer to Super fund 
 
Hello Liz. 
Please see email from Robyn. 
Regards. 

 

Neil Muller 
Director at Duralloy Truck Bodies 

 

 

A 15- 17 Kabi Circuit Deception Bay QLD 4508 
P (07) 3293 2923 E neil@duralloy.com.au -
W www.duralloy.com.au    
 

 

      

 

SUBSCRIBE TO OUR NEWSLETTERSee what the team have been up to 
IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential. They 
are intended for the named recipient(s) only. If you have received this email by 
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mistake, please notify the sender immediately and do not disclose the contents to 
anyone or make copies thereof. 
 

 
 

From: Robyn Wellner <robyn@wellner.com.au>  
Sent: Wednesday, 23 June 2021 12:22 PM 
To: Neil Muller <neil@duralloy.com.au> 
Subject: RE: Transfer to Super fund 
 
Hello Neil 
 
The Duratray transfer has registered.  The other one, I have just received a requisition… I will contact you next week 
re this.  The date of registration should still be the date I lodged the paperwork earlier this month. 
 
Regards 
 

 
PLEASE NOTE THAT WE HAVE MOVED OFFICE 

 
OUR NEW ADDRESS IS:    63 ROWLAND AVENUE WAKERLEY 4151. 

TELEPHONE NUMBERS AND POSTAL ADDRESS HAVE NOT CHANGED. 
 
 
 
CAUTION on money transfers: 
We have reports that scammers are attempting to hijack emails with bank account details so they can substitute 
their own account number.  
As a result DO NOT deposit money to an account nominated by us without verifying the account number by phone. 
We will not use bank account details supplied by you without verification by phone. 
 

 
 
Robyn Wellner 
Wellners Lawyers 
PO Box 2012 
Tingalpa Qld 4173 
 
Ph:  07 3890 1899 

 
 
 

 

IMPORTANT NOTICE TO CLIENTS AND PRACTITIONERS 
As of 1 July 2016 we are operating on a part time basis only. The office will be open  Mondays, Tuesdays, and 1/2 

day Wednesdays by appointment only 
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This message is intended only for the use of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and confidential 
information.  If you are not the addressee you are notified that any transmission distribution or photocopying of this email 
is strictly prohibited.  The legal privilege and confidentiality attached to this email is not waived lost or destroyed by reason 
of mistaken delivery to you.  If you have received this email in error please notify us by telephone. 

 
 

From: Neil Muller <neil@duralloy.com.au>  
Sent: Wednesday, 23 June 2021 11:05 AM 
To: Robyn Wellner <robyn@wellner.com.au> 
Subject: RE: Transfer to Super fund 
 
Hello Robyn. 
 
Update please. 
 
Has the title on property 15-17 Kabi Circuit been corrected? 
Will property 19-21 Kabi Circuit be transferred before or after June 30 ? 
Will the Ray White property appraisal still be ok , or  will it be outdated? 
 
Regards. 
 

 

Neil Muller 
Director at Duralloy Truck Bodies 

 

 

A 15- 17 Kabi Circuit Deception Bay QLD 4508 
P (07) 3293 2923 E neil@duralloy.com.au -
W www.duralloy.com.au    
 

 

      

 

SUBSCRIBE TO OUR NEWSLETTERSee what the team have been up to 
IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential. They 
are intended for the named recipient(s) only. If you have received this email by 
mistake, please notify the sender immediately and do not disclose the contents to 
anyone or make copies thereof. 
 

 
 

From: Robyn Wellner <robyn@wellner.com.au>  
Sent: Tuesday, 18 May 2021 12:57 PM 
To: Neil Muller <neil@duralloy.com.au> 
Subject: RE: Transfer to Super fund 
 
Hello Neil 
 
I need to pay the stamp duty first before I lodge the transfer document.  It would be appropriate for the Super Fund 
to pay the stamp duty as it is the entity that ought to pay in anyway. 
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PLEASE NOTE THAT WE HAVE MOVED OFFICE 

 
OUR NEW ADDRESS IS:    63 ROWLAND AVENUE WAKERLEY 4151. 

TELEPHONE NUMBERS AND POSTAL ADDRESS HAVE NOT CHANGED. 
 
 
 
CAUTION on money transfers: 
We have reports that scammers are attempting to hijack emails with bank account details so they can substitute 
their own account number.  
As a result DO NOT deposit money to an account nominated by us without verifying the account number by phone. 
We will not use bank account details supplied by you without verification by phone. 
 

 
 
Robyn Wellner 
Wellners Lawyers 
PO Box 2012 
Tingalpa Qld 4173 
 
Ph:  07 3890 1899 

 
 
 

 

IMPORTANT NOTICE TO CLIENTS AND PRACTITIONERS 
As of 1 July 2016 we are operating on a part time basis only. The office will be open  Mondays, Tuesdays, and 1/2 

day Wednesdays by appointment only 
 
 

This message is intended only for the use of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and confidential 
information.  If you are not the addressee you are notified that any transmission distribution or photocopying of this email 
is strictly prohibited.  The legal privilege and confidentiality attached to this email is not waived lost or destroyed by reason 
of mistaken delivery to you.  If you have received this email in error please notify us by telephone. 

 
 

From: Neil Muller <neil@duralloy.com.au>  
Sent: Tuesday, 18 May 2021 12:53 PM 
To: Robyn Wellner <robyn@wellner.com.au> 
Subject: RE: Transfer to Super fund 
 
Hello Robyn. 
Do we hold the stamp duty funds in the Super fund  until the transfer goes through?  
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Neil Muller 
Director at Duralloy Truck Bodies 

 

 

A 15- 17 Kabi Circuit Deception Bay QLD 4508 
P (07) 3293 2923 E neil@duralloy.com.au -
W www.duralloy.com.au    
 

 

      

 

SUBSCRIBE TO OUR NEWSLETTERSee what the team have been up to 
IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential. They 
are intended for the named recipient(s) only. If you have received this email by 
mistake, please notify the sender immediately and do not disclose the contents to 
anyone or make copies thereof. 
 

  
  

From: Robyn Wellner <robyn@wellner.com.au>  
Sent: Tuesday, 18 May 2021 10:10 AM 
To: Neil Muller <neil@duralloy.com.au> 
Subject: Transfer to Super fund 
  
Hello Neil, 
  
I am preparing the papers for lodging this week.  Would you please arrange for the payment of stamp duty on the 
transfer to the super fund. 
  
I attach a copy of the tax invoice, noting you have paid the other outlays but for the stamp duty in the sum of 
$28,237.50. 
  
Regards 
  

 
PLEASE NOTE THAT WE HAVE MOVED OFFICE 

  
OUR NEW ADDRESS IS:    63 ROWLAND AVENUE WAKERLEY 4151. 

TELEPHONE NUMBERS AND POSTAL ADDRESS HAVE NOT CHANGED. 
  
  
  
CAUTION on money transfers: 
We have reports that scammers are attempting to hijack emails with bank account details so they can substitute 
their own account number.  
As a result DO NOT deposit money to an account nominated by us without verifying the account number by phone. 
We will not use bank account details supplied by you without verification by phone. 
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Robyn Wellner 
Wellners Lawyers 
PO Box 2012 
Tingalpa Qld 4173 
  
Ph:  07 3890 1899 

  
  
  

  
IMPORTANT NOTICE TO CLIENTS AND PRACTITIONERS 

As of 1 July 2016 we are operating on a part time basis only. The office will be open  Mondays, Tuesdays, and 1/2 
day Wednesdays by appointment only 

  
  

This message is intended only for the use of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and confidential 
information.  If you are not the addressee you are notified that any transmission distribution or photocopying of this email 
is strictly prohibited.  The legal privilege and confidentiality attached to this email is not waived lost or destroyed by reason 
of mistaken delivery to you.  If you have received this email in error please notify us by telephone. 

  
  


