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Elizabeth Meiklejohn

From: Oleg Samarski <OlegS@nojapower.com.au>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 July 2021 8:27 AM

To: Stephanie Natividad; Elizabeth Meiklejohn

Cc: Svetlana Samarski

Subject: RE: Closing of Westpac Super account - O & S Samarski Superannuation Fund

Thank you Stephanie 
 
Hi Elizabeth,  
 
Just  notice – the account already closed and 10c coin is still with me (8c as the balance of the account were rounded 
up for cash payment to 10c) 
 
Best Regards, 
Oleg 
 

 
Oleg Samarski  
Quality And Service Director 

 

 

T: +61 7 3907 8777 
F: +61 7 3399 6777 
M: +61 438 690 664 

 
16 Archimedes Place • Murarrie • Brisbane • Australia • QLD 4172 
www.nojapower.com.au  

 

     

 

 
 
WARNING: This email contains information which is CONFIDENTIAL and may be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not read, use, copy or 
distribute this email or attachments. If you have received this email in error, please notify me immediately by return email, or telephone (call collect) and delete this 
email.  
 

From: Stephanie Natividad <StephanieN@mtaccountants.com.au>  

Sent: Wednesday, 14 July 2021 8:18 

To: Oleg Samarski <OlegS@nojapower.com.au>; Virtu - ElizabethM - External <Elizabethm@virtusuper.com.au> 

Cc: Svetlana Samarski <lanasamarski@outlook.com> 

Subject: RE: Closing of Westpac Super account - O & S Samarski Superannuation Fund 

 

Hi Oleg, 
 
Thanks for your email. 
 
I will forward your email to Elizabeth who looks after your SMSF. She will be able to guide you in terms closing a bank 
account and transferring funds to the new account. 
 
Kind regards, 
Stephanie 
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PS – We are always open for new business so please pass on our details to any friends, family or colleagues whom 
would benefit from our services. 

 

 

Creating peace of mind,  
financial success, and freedom of choice 

 

    

Stephanie Natividad | Senior Accountant 

 07 3422 8000 

 PO Box 83 Mount Gravatt Q 4122 

 Lvl 1, 1454 Logan Rd Mt Gravatt Central Q 4122 

 www.marshtincknell.com.au                   

    

    

Marsh Tincknell Pty Ltd ACN 137 316 815 
Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards legislation 
Disclaimer: If the information in this email relates to your business, personal or financial affairs, it is either factual or was in relation to taxation advice, 
therefore does not constitute financial product advice and should not be relied upon as financial product advice. Taxation is only one of the matters that you 
need to consider when making a decision and none of the information provided takes into account your personal objectives, financial situation or needs. You 
must determine whether the information is appropriate in terms of your particular circumstances. For financial product advice that takes account of your 
particular objectives, financial situation or needs, you should consider seeking financial advice from an Australian Financial Services licensee before making 
a financial decision. 
Please note that collection, use and storage of all information held by the MT Group is governed by our Privacy Policy. This email and any attachment are 
confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify Marsh Tincknell by reply email and delete this email. Please note that you must not access or 
use this email or any information in it. Marsh Tincknell accepts no liability for viruses in this email or in any attachment to it.  

From: Oleg Samarski  

Sent: Tuesday, 13 July 2021 1:45 PM 

To: Stephanie Natividad  

Cc: Svetlana Samarski  

Subject: Closing of Westpac Super account 

 

Hi Stephanie 
 
We tried to close last business/super related Westpac account by the end of June but unfortunately we didn’t get it 
done for number of reasons. We closed LBS business and one Super but second super account was closed today 
only. Unfortunately there was a 8 cents on this account the I got 10c cash in the branch.  
 
While it is 10c only, I don’t want to trigger the audit or other discussion with the auditor or the ATO.  
 
I can deposit 10c to CBA account. Can you please let us know what should we do (if anything)?  
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Best Regards, 
Oleg 
 

 
Oleg Samarski  
Quality And Service Director 

 

 

T: +61 7 3907 8777 
F: +61 7 3399 6777 
M: +61 438 690 664 

 
16 Archimedes Place • Murarrie • Brisbane • Australia • QLD 4172 
www.nojapower.com.au  

 

 
 

 
 
WARNING: This email contains information which is CONFIDENTIAL and may be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not read, use, copy or 
distribute this email or attachments. If you have received this email in error, please notify me immediately by return email, or telephone (call collect) and delete this 
email.  
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