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Brenda Wishey

From: Anderson, Elaine <eanderson@burrell.com.au>
Sent: Thursday, 20 April 2023 10:11 AM
To: Brenda Wishey
Subject: RE: Maurice J Costello Dental SF - 30 June 2022

Hi 
 
I have just read the notes and spoken to the adviser – Mr Costello has been transferred to an Aged Care Facility – I 
don’t think there will be any activity on the site in the short term 
 
thanks 
 
E 
 

Elaine Anderson 
Director 
Portfolio Service 
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Disclaimer & Disclosure: Burrell Stockbroking Pty Ltd and its associates state that they and/or their families or companies or trusts 
may have an interest in the securities mentioned in this document and do receive commissions or fees from the sale or purchase 
of securities mentioned therein. Burrell Stockbroking and its associates also state that the comments are intended to provide 
information to our clients exclusively and reflects our view on the securities concerned and does not take account of the 
appropriateness of the recommendation for any particular client who should obtain specific professional advice from his or her 
Burrell Stockbroking Pty Ltd advisor on the suitability of the recommendation. Whilst we believe that the statements herein are 
based on accurate and reliable information, no warranty is given to its accuracy and completeness and Burrell Stockbroking Pty 
Ltd, its Directors and employees do not accept any liability for any loss arising as a result of a person acting thereon.  
 
This document contains general securities advice only. In accordance with Section 949A of the Corporations Act, in preparing this 
document, Burrell Stockbroking did not take into account the investment objectives, financial situation and particular needs 
('relevant personal circumstances') of any particular person. Accordingly, before acting on any advice contained in this document 
you should assess whether the advice is appropriate in the light of your own relevant personal circumstances or contact your 
Burrell Stockbroking advisor. If the advice relates to the acquisition, or possible acquisition, of a particular financial product, you 
should obtain a Product Disclosure Statement relating to the product and consider the Statement before making any decision 
about whether to acquire the product. Burrell Stockbroking Pty Ltd (ABN 82 088 958 481), a Participant of the ASX Group and the 
NSX.  
 
To unsubscribe from this email, please forward this email to info@burrell.com.au 

From: Brenda Wishey <BrendaW@virtusuper.com.au>  
Sent: Thursday, 20 April 2023 9:27 AM 
To: Anderson, Elaine <eanderson@burrell.com.au> 
Subject: RE: Maurice J Costello Dental SF - 30 June 2022 
 
We will take up the $500 as a creditor and request the trustees be reimbursed before 30th June 2023. 
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Are the clients planning on rebuilding on the land?  
 
Brenda 
 

 

Brenda Wishey 
Senior Accountant
 

VIRTU  | self managed super specialists
  

1454 Logan Road, Mount Gravatt Q 4122
 
 

  07 3349 1452
 

  PO BOX 83 Mount Gravatt Q 4122
 

  www.virtusuper.com.au
    

 

 
Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards legislation  
Virtu Super Pty Ltd ACN 134 260 512  
 
Please note that collection, use and storage of all information held by the Virtu Super is governed by our Privacy Policy.  
This email and any attachment are confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify Virtu Super by reply email and delete this email.  
Please note that you must not access or use this email or any information in it. Virtu Super accepts no liability for viruses in this email or in any attachment to it. 
From: Anderson, Elaine <eanderson@burrell.com.au>  
Sent: Thursday, April 20, 2023 8:51 AM 
To: Brenda Wishey <BrendaW@virtusuper.com.au> 
Subject: RE: Maurice J Costello Dental SF - 30 June 2022 
 
hmmmmm! 
 
looks to me like there were 2 invoices paid  - see attached for $1000 each,  
 
looks like the client should have been reimbursed the $500 but I can’t see where it was 
 
E 
 

Elaine Anderson 
Director 
Portfolio Service 
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