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Rachel Green-Luther

From: superfund@tigfs.com.au

Sent: Thursday, June 24, 2021 5:52 PM

To: Rachel Green-Luther

Cc: Elizabeth Meiklejohn; 'Colin Harvey'

Subject: RE: R & L Hegarty Superannuation Fund - Property Est Tax and costs

Hi Everyone 

Just want to let you know that we have sold for $325K. 

I should have the contract come through tomorrow so will forward when I get it. 

Regards 

Lindy 

 

From: Rachel Green-Luther <RachelG@virtusuper.com.au>  

Sent: Thursday, 24 June 2021 4:30 PM 

To: superfund@tigfs.com.au 

Cc: Elizabeth Meiklejohn <ElizabethM@virtusuper.com.au>; 'Colin Harvey' <colin@altuspartners.com.au> 

Subject: RE: R & L Hegarty Superannuation Fund - Property Est Tax and costs 

 

Hi Lindy and Robert,  
 
No, it won’t make much difference. I’d still say low $2,000.  
 
Good luck with the counter. I have my fingers crossed for you.  
 
Kind regards, 
Rach  
 
Rachel Green-Luther  CPA
 

Senior Accountant 
 

 
PS – We are always open for new business so please pass on our details to any friends, family or colleagues whom would benefit from our services.

  

 
Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards legislation 

 

 

Virtu Super Pty Ltd ACN 134 260 512

 

Please note that collection, use and storage of all information held by the Virtu Super is governed by our Privacy Policy. This email and any attachment are 
confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify Virtu Super by reply email and delete this email. Please note that you must not access or use this email 
or any information in it. Virtu Super accepts no liability for viruses in this email or in any attachment to it. 
  

From: superfund@tigfs.com.au <superfund@tigfs.com.au>  

Sent: Thursday, June 24, 2021 4:27 PM 

To: Rachel Green-Luther <RachelG@virtusuper.com.au> 

Cc: Elizabeth Meiklejohn <ElizabethM@virtusuper.com.au>; 'Colin Harvey' <colin@altuspartners.com.au> 

Subject: RE: R & L Hegarty Superannuation Fund - Property Est Tax and costs 

 

Hi Rach 

If settlement isn’t until 10 August, will this make much difference?? 

We are getting close but are still waiting on the buyer after our counter. 
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                      CURRENT TITLE SEARCH
               NATURAL RESOURCES, MINES AND ENERGY, QUEENSLAND
 Request No: 34738864
Search Date: 21/08/2020 10:04                      Title Reference: 50792530
                                                      Date Created: 02/12/2009
 
Previous Title: 50729716
 
REGISTERED OWNER
 
Dealing No: 718937079  20/08/2018

ROBERT WILLIAM HEGARTY
LINDY MAE HEGARTY             TRUSTEE
        UNDER INSTRUMENT 718937079
 
ESTATE AND LAND
 
 Estate in Fee Simple
 
 LOT 30     SURVEY PLAN 204852
            Local Government: LOGAN
            COMMUNITY MANAGEMENT STATEMENT 40875
 
EASEMENTS, ENCUMBRANCES AND INTERESTS
 
     1. Rights and interests reserved to the Crown by
        Deed of Grant No. 10290013 (POR 12)
 
     2. LEASE No 718936997  20/08/2018 at 11:31
        THE INEVENTS GROUP (TIG) PTY LTD A.C.N. 626 851 205
        OF THE WHOLE OF THE LAND
        TERM: 02/07/2018 TO 01/07/2021 OPTION 3 YEARS
 
ADMINISTRATIVE ADVICES - NIL
UNREGISTERED DEALINGS  - NIL
 
 

Caution - Charges do not necessarily appear in order of priority

                      ** End of Current Title Search **

COPYRIGHT THE STATE OF QUEENSLAND (NATURAL RESOURCES, MINES AND ENERGY) [2020]
Requested By: D-ENQ GLOBALX
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