Stacey Keleher

From: Adrian Tan <adriant@mtaccountants.com.au>
Sent: Monday, 11 July 2022 1:03 PM

To: Stacey Keleher

Subject: RE: Director ID

Yup no worries ©

036 99378 41373 79

PS — We are always open for new business so please pass on our details to any friends, family or colleagues whom
would benefit from our services.

Adrian Tan | Manager

g1 marshtincknell | 573422 8000

tered Accountants
X PO Box 83, Mount Gravatt Q 4122
Creating peace of mind, QL 1, 1454 Logan Rd Mt Gravatt Central Q 4122
financial success, and freedom of choice | @ www.marshtincknell.com.au

(] [in] pay your bill online

Marsh Tincknell Pty Ltd ACN 137 316 815

Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards legislation

Disclaimer: If the information in this email relates to your business, personal or financial affairs, it is either factual or was in relation to taxation advice, therefore
does not constitute financial product advice and should not be relied upon as financial product advice. Taxation is only one of the matters that you need to
consider when making a decision and none of the information provided takes into account your personal objectives, financial situation or needs. You must
determine whether the information is appropriate in terms of your particular circumstances. For financial product advice that takes account of your particular
objectives, financial situation or needs, you should consider seeking financial advice from an Australian Financial Services licensee before making a financial
decision.

Please note that collection, use and storage of all information held by the MT Group is governed by our Privacy Policy. This email and any attachment are
confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify Marsh Tincknell by reply email and delete this email. Please note that you must not access or use
this email or any information in it. Marsh Tincknell accepts no liability for viruses in this email or in any attachment to it.

From: Stacey Keleher <StaceyK@virtusuper.com.au>
Sent: Monday, 11 July 2022 12:26 PM

To: Adrian Tan <adriant@mtaccountants.com.au>
Subject: FW: Director ID

Hi Adrian,
Do you happen to have Matt Edwards’ Director ID?

Cheers,
Stacey



Stacey Keleher
Administration Assistant
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Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards legislation
Virtu Super Pty Ltd ACN 134 260 512

Please note that collection, use and storage of all information held by the Virtu Super is governed by our Privacy Policy.
This email and any attachment are confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify Virtu Super by reply email and delete this email.
Please note that you must not access or use this email or any information in it. Virtu Super accepts no liability for viruses in this email or in any attachment to it.

From: Matthew Edwards <matt@mdeprop.com>
Sent: Monday, 11 July 2022 10:57 AM

To: Stacey Keleher <StaceyK@virtusuper.com.au>
Subject: Re: Director ID

Hi Stacey,

| can’t access it at the moment but | have previously sent it Adrian Tan so he should have it on file if you want to check
with him.

On Mon, 11 Jul 2022 at 10:35, Stacey Keleher <StaceyK@virtusuper.com.au> wrote:

Good morning Matt,

Apologies if you have sent this through earlier, but I’'m wondering if you have completed your Director ID application?
If so, could you please send through your 15 digit number for our records.

We already have Emily, Toby & Anika’s on file.

Kind regards,

Stacey
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Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards legislation
Virtu Super Pty Ltd ACN 134 260 512

Please note that collection, use and storage of all information held by the Virtu Super is governed by our Privacy Policy.
This email and any attachment are confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify Virtu Super by reply email and delete this email.
Please note that you must not access or use this email or any information in it. Virtu Super accepts no liability for viruses in this email or in any attachment to it.

Regards,

Matt Edwards
MDE Property
0499 669 002
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