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Brian Roughley

From: Khanh Tran [khanh.tran@bechini.com.au]
Sent: Friday, 26 June 2020 4:47 PM
To: brian@bwraccounting.com.au
Cc: matthew@bechini.com.au; Roma
Subject: RE: super

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Brian 

 

We act as accountant for FJVC Unit Trust 

 

The trust has sold 13 Pandanus Circuit, Bolwarra on 8/5/2020 for gross profit of $64,000 

 

If you have any questions in respect of the above, please don’t hesitate to contact our office. 

 

Kind Regards 

 

Khanh Tran 

Bechini & Associates (incorporating GK Plus Co Accountants) 

Chartered Accountants 

Suite 1, Level 1, 210-216 Hume Highway, Lansvale NSW 2166 

PO Box 3010, Lansvale NSW 2166 

Phone:  (02) 9755 7466 

Facsimile:  (02) 9755 4577        
Email:  Khanh@bechini.com.au  
 
 
This message is intended for the use of the party to whom it is addressed and may contain information which is 
confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient and have received this communication in error, please 
notify us by telephone or email and ensure its destruction. Any dissemination or copying of this communication and its 
attachments by anyone other than the party to whom it is addressed is strictly prohibited.  
Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards Legislation. 
 

From: Roma [mailto:romasteel@bigpond.com]  

Sent: Friday, 26 June 2020 11:51 AM 

To: matthew@bechini.com.au 

Cc: Khanh Tran <khanh.tran@bechini.com.au> 

Subject: FW: super 

 

 

Hi Matt  /  Khanh 

 

Hope all is well 

 

 

Could you Please supply the following information below 

 
 

Regards, 

Carlo 
ROMA STEEL FABRICATION  PTY LTD 

P:   02 97563210 
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M:  0415 406 406 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

From: Brian Roughley [mailto:brian@bwraccounting.com.au]  

Sent: Friday, 26 June 2020 11:27 AM 

To: 'Roma' 
Subject: super 

 

 
 

 

Hi carlo 

 

For the investment in the unit trust, we want a letter form the unit trust’s accountant stating that: 

 

The development by the unit trust was completed, sold and settled on  DATE? and was profitable.  

 

 
Regards, Brian 
 
 

BWR Accounting Pty Limited 

ABN 85102629550 
Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional  
Standards Legislation 
 
Ph 02 96375158 Fax 02 98971424 
 
email: brian@bwraccounting.com.au 
  
The contents of this e.mail and its attachments are confidential. 
Any unauthorised use of the contents is expressly prohibited.  
If you receive this e.mail in error, please contact us immediately,  
then delete the e.mail. 
  
It is the addressee/recipient(s) duty to virus scan and otherwise test 
the information provided before loading onto any computer system. 
BWR Accounting Pty Limited does not warrant that the information 
is free of a virus or any other defect or error. 

 
 


