
Y14635551
MyNorth Investment

Abegg Family Superannuation Fund
1 July 2019 to 30 June 2020

Investment Statement

  Transaction details - cash account

Date Type Description Amount

Opening value as at 1 July 2019 $156,817.90

Balance

02/07/2019 Administration fees Account fee $(0.49) $156,817.41

02/07/2019 Interest Interest $133.18 $156,950.59

02/07/2019 Redemption Full redemption $(156,950.59) $0.00

28/05/2020 General Adjustment General adjustment $146.72 $146.72

Closing value as at 30 June 2020 $146.72

Note: Any cash transactions occurring after 30/06/2020 that are related to the 2019-2020 financial year, are not
included in the transaction details.

  Transaction details - term deposit

No term deposit transactions for the period  1 July 2019 to 30 June 2020

  Transaction details - investments

No Investment transactions for the period  1 July 2019 to 30 June 2020
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Sunidhi Chauhan

From: Melissa Vowles

Sent: Friday, 24 July 2020 4:59 PM

To: Sunidhi Chauhan

Subject: Fwd: ABEG0007 & PENN0007 : April - June 2020 Reports

Attachments: 200630 - Macquarie Statement 1.01.2020 to 30.06.2020 - Abegg Superfund.pdf;

200630 - Macquarie Statement 1.01.2020 to 30.06.2020 - Pennefather

Superfund.pdf; 200630 - HUB24 Review Report 1.04.2020 to 30.06.2020 -

Pennefather Superfund.pdf; 200630 - HUB24 Review Report 1.04.2020 to

30.06.2020 - Abegg Superfund.pdf; 200630 - North Statement 1.04.2020 to

15.07.2020 - Abegg Superfund.pdf; 200630 - North Statement 1.04.2020 to

15.07.2020 - Pennefather Superfund.pdf

From: Travis Smith <Travis_Smith@arrivewealthmanagement.com.au>
Sent: Friday, July 24, 2020 4:55:43 PM
To: Melissa Vowles <melissa.vowles@macrogroup.com.au>
Cc: Jay Murphy <Jay_murphy@arrivewealthmanagement.com.au>; Macro Group Admin
<admin@macrogroup.com.au>
Subject: RE: ABEG0007 & PENN0007 : April - June 2020 Reports

Hi Melissa,

Please find attached:

• Bank statements for Macquarie Cash Management A/c from 1 January 2020 to 30 June 2020
• HUB24 review reports from 1 April 2020 to 30 June 2020
• North Statements from 1April 2020 to July 2020

North had a residual payment come into the accounts which we have instructed them to move to the Macquarie
accounts; unfortunately it didn’t finalise until July.

If you have any questions please let me know.

Regards

Travis

Travis Smith
Associate | Arrive Wealth Management

Level 28, 480 Queen Street, Brisbane QLD 4000 | GPO Box 566, Brisbane QLD 4001 | T 07 3001 7017
travis_smith@arrivewealthmanagement.com.au | www.arrivewealthmanagement.com.au

Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards Legislation

For more information, please refer to our FSCG. Any general advice in this email does not take account of your personal objectives, financial situation and

sunidhi.chauhan
Rectangle
North had a residual payment come into the accounts which we have instructed them to move to the Macquarie

accounts; unfortunately it didn’t finalise until July.



2

needs, and because of that, you should, before acting on the advice, consider the appropriateness of the advice, having regard to your objectives, financial
situation and needs. Also, you should read the relevant Product Disclosure Statement before acquiring any product mentioned in this email. This email
is confidential and is for the intended recipient only. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not use or rely on this information, delete all copies of this
email and contact us on 07 3001 7000. If you do not want to receive any more emails from us, please let us know by return email.

From: Melissa Vowles <melissa.vowles@macrogroup.com.au>
Sent: Thursday, 23 July 2020 1:57 PM
To: Travis Smith <Travis_Smith@arrivewealthmanagement.com.au>
Cc: Macro Group Admin <admin@macrogroup.com.au>
Subject: ABEG0007 & PENN0007 : April - June 2020 Reports

Hi Travis

Hope you are well.

We are continuing our quarterly processing for the Abegg and Pennefather Sfund’s. Would you be able to send
through the following information for both.

1. A copy of bank statements for Macquarie Cash Management A/c from 1 April 2020 to 30 June 2020
2. HUB24 review report from 1 April 2020 to 30 June 2020

3. Documentation for any other new investments/bank accounts//transfers in/out.

Thanks for your assistance.

Kind regards

Melissa

Melissa Vowles
Manager | Chartered
Accountant

07 3844 5555
melissa.vowles@macrogroup.com.au
www.macrogroup.com.au

Level 1, Suite 4, 220 Melbourne Street,
South Brisbane QLD 4101
PO Box 3555, South Brisbane BC QLD 4101

Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards Legislation.
This message and any attachments are confidential and may contain legally privileged
information and/or copyright material. It must not be distributed, altered or the information
contained in it disseminated, without the authority of The Macro Group. The information
contained in it is intended for the use of the authorised recipient only. If you have received this
message in error please return to sender and delete this message from your system, and
destroy printed copies.
Responsible person: Nicole Bryant | Chartered Accountant
Limited AFSL: 485843 Nicole Bryant

Message protected by MailGuard: e-mail anti-virus, anti-spam and content filtering.
http://www.mailguard.com.au/mg
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