JenniferGibbon

From: Office Email <office@infinitasmgt.com.au>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 November 2022 3:14 PM

To: JenniferGibbon

Subject: Re: VC2017 Minmi

Attachments: VC2017 26-07-2021 Capital Call Notice - Frank & Pamela Needs ATF Minmi Superannuation
Fund.pdf

Hi Jenny,

The outgoing of $1800 is a capital call for 6%, please see attached the capital call notice for your reference.
Hence VC2017 is currently 97% paid and the remaining 3% uncalled capital would be $900.

Kind regards,
Ellie Fu

Infinitas Asset Management Limited
AFSL 326087

P: 61 (02) 8296 0818
Portfolio Management & Investment Adpisory Services

Disclosure & Disclaimer

The above information contains general advice only. We note that you have not requested personal advice and highlight that this information does not constitute personal advice. The
contents do not take into account personal objectives, financial situation or needs of any particular person. Prior to making an investment decision, all information should be considered
relevant to a person’s individual investment goals and personal circumstances including consultation with a licensed and qualified adviser.

The directors and staff of Infinitas Asset Management Limited have interests in many of the stocks discussed, recommended and included in our model portfolios. Infinitas and a related
entity, Veritas Securities Limited, may seek corporate advisory and securities underwriting relationships with companies discussed, recommended and included in our model portfolios.

On Wed, 9 Nov 2022 at 15:00, JenniferGibbon <jgibbon@bigpond.net.au> wrote:

Hi Ellie,

| just have a query re VC2017. See below response from Sherry in prior year. This year there was a capital call of $1800.
Do you have the paperwork for that? Also can you please confirm that there is still $900 owing?

1. For VC2017 | have only the following purchase costs $16910.22 & $15918.78 whereas on the transaction list it
says purchase price $38829 There is another $3,300 paid in Dec 2020. Please see attached the capital call
letter for your reference. Currently 91% has been paid.

Thank you

Kind Regards



Jenny
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