Stuart Flinn

From: Gaylene Cooper <gcooper@launcestoneye.com.au>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 July 2021 11:31 AM
To: Stuart Flinn
Subject: FW: Vote Super - Clinic Unit Trust Financials 2020
Attachments: 2020 financial statements and tax return signed - Clinic Unit Trust Group (2).pdf
Categories: Filed in FYI
Hi Stuart

This is the entry | sent you on the 5" July. | see you have queried it in the latest email, not sure if you need further
information?

Kind regards

Gaylene Cooper
Personal Assistant to Dr Brendan Vote

LAUNCESTON EYI

Launceston Eye Institute
Level One

36 Thistle Street West
South Launceston 7249

P: 6344 1377
M: 0427 272 061
F: 6344 1577

E: gcooper@launcestoneye.com.au

IMPORTANT NOTICE This email, along with any attachments, is for the use of the intended recipient(s) only and may contain information that is

confidential and may contain proprietary or legally privileged or protected information and is intended for the authorized recipient of the sender. If you are not
the intended recipient, or if you have received this email in error, please immediately notify the sender by telephone or by return email and destroy the email
and any hard copy you may have generated. You are hereby notified that any use, disclosure, copying, or distribution of this message or any of the information
included in it is unauthorized and strictly prohibited.  Although we have taken reasonable precautions to ensure no viruses are present in this email, we
cannot accept responsibility for any loss or damage arising from the use of this email or attachments.

From: Gaylene Cooper

Sent: Monday, 5 July 2021 11:18 AM

To: Stuart Flinn <StuartFlinn@sidcor.com.au>
Subject: Vote Super - Clinic Unit Trust Financials 2020

Hi Stuart



Here are the 2020 Financials. | will send you another email with some information from Chantelle which you may
also need.

RE the $296,849.78, this is how | have coded it in MYOB, so not sure what else you need? Brendan sold some of his
units and this was the proceeds.

Deposzit to Account:{ 1-1710 & Cheque Account Balance o $23.554.50

v Taxlnclusive

Payar | Sunstane Capital $| D #: | CROOO345
Armount Received: | $296,549.73 Date: | 3/04/2020
Papment Method: | Direct Credit = | Details...

b emio:; | Sunstone Capital - $300k zale of 57,625 units -

Acct # M ame Arnounk Job b erno Tax
4-9100 CUT Sale of 5% af share $300.000.00 Sale of 57625 Unitz $300K) _l
E-1010 Leqal & Professional Fees -$2.750.00
B-5115 Sundries -$88.00
B-5115 Sundries $212.22
E-5115 Sundries -$100.00 gtamp duty M-T

Kind regards
Gaylene

From: Chantelle Cox <chantellec@synecticgroup.com.au>
Sent: Monday, 5 July 2021 11:10 AM

To: Gaylene Cooper <gcooper@launcestoneye.com.au>
Subject: Clinic Unit Trust

Hi Gaylene

Hope your have been keeping well.

2020 accounts & ITR for Clinic Unit Trust attached.
Regards

Chantelle Cox | Client Manager | Synectic

49 Best St, Devonport, Tasmania

PO Box 6003, Devonport, Tasmania, Australia 7310

Phone 03 6424 1451 | Fax 03 6424 7144
chantellec@synecticgroup.com.au | www.synecticgroup.com.au

Synectic =8 v m B

Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards Legislation.
This email is intended solely for the recipient. Unauthorised use is prohibited. Please notify if received in error.






