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From: Tom Stewart <tombay1@bigpond.com>
Sent: Thursday, 17 December 2020 6:51 PM
To: Sue Lawson <sue@cleave.com.au>
Subject: Re: Stewarts Super “und 2020

Hi Sue
Regarding rates and water, you are correct in that they are not billad individually.

$8500.00 of the council bond was refunded in the current financial year, with $1500.00 still
being held until Sept. 2021.

Still a hefty infrastructure bil. due by 1/7/2021, postponed because of COVID 19.
Regards

Margaret

Sent from my iPad

On 17 Dec 2020, at 1:33 pm, Sue Lawson <sue@cleave.coni.au> wrote:

Hi Margaret & Tom

With regards to your super fund, there is an invoice for Ac:-ord Quantity
Surveyors for depreciztion schedules for the house and th = duplex.

It would be appreciated if you could forward these schedu,2s to me.

Also there was a council bond of $10000.00. Is this refund:zhle?
I am assuming that the rates and the water invoices will no! be issued
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