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Re: Additional Information Required for your SMSF

1 message

Superhelp Support <support@superhelp.com.au>

Adam Havryliv <adam@eccm.com.au> Thu, Mar 3, 2022 at 4:11 PM
To: Superhelp Support <support@superhelp.com.au>
Cc: Simone Haslinger <simone@eccm.com.au>

Hi,

Yes and the good news is that it has been repaid in full with interest as of the end of February 2022 in the amount of $226,240.72. These funds will be used to settle on the
newly purchased property and provide a cash buffer for repayments.

Thanks & regards,
Adam
On Thu, 3 Mar 2022 at 16:07, Superhelp Support <support@superhelp.com.au> wrote:
Dear Mr. Havryliv,
Auditing for your SMSF is in progress. Please supply information as per the attachment for your SMSF to help us complete the activity.
Yours Sincerely,
Hannah
Client Services
SuperHelp Australia Pty Ltd
Phone: 1300 736 453
Address: P O Box 1906, MACQUARIE CENTRE NSW 2113

website: www.superhelp.com.au

Confidentiality: This e-mail is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please notify immediately by return e-mail and destroy all copies of this message.

Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards Legislation.
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