Karen Barnes - Green Frog Super

From: Priscilla D'Orio - Green Frog Super

Sent: Tuesday, 11 August 2020 6:11 PM

To: Karen Barnes — Green Frog Super

Subject: FW: Invoice INV-00011184 from Reserve Vault Australia Pty Ltd for R & S Harris
Superannuation Pty Ltd atf R & S Harris Superannuation Fund

Attachments: image001.png; ATT00001.htm; ~WRDO0O005.jpg; ATT00002.htm; 195 - Certificate of

Currency for Reserve Vault 2020-2021.pdf; ATT00003.htm; RVA MRC Quote Client Copy
May2020.pdf; ATT00004.htm

From: Russell Harris [mailto:russellharris38 @hotmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 11 August 2020 5:48 PM

To: Priscilla D'Orio - Green Frog Super <Priscilla@greenfrogsuper.com.au>

Subject: Fwd: Invoice INV-00011184 from Reserve Vault Australia Pty Ltd for R & S Harris Superannuation Pty Ltd atf R &
S Harris Superannuation Fund

Here it is Priscilla

Russell

Begin forwarded message:

From: Customer Service <customer-service@reservevault.com.au>

Date: 7 August 2020 at 3:30:40 pm AEST

To: Russell Harris <russellharris38 @hotmail.com>

Subject: RE: Invoice INV-00011184 from Reserve Vault Australia Pty Ltd for R & S Harris
Superannuation Pty Ltd atf R & S Harris Superannuation Fund

Hi Russell
Please find attached the Certificate of Currency for the Insurance and the Policy wording.

You will note that the dates on the Certificate don’t match your invoice, that is due to it being our group
policy renewal dates.

The document with the wording had pages deleted at the start and end as these pages continued
commercial in confidence information.

Should you have any issues opening the attachment, please don’t hesitate to contact us.

Regards

Rebecca

Reserve Vault Australia
customer-service@reservevault.com.au




