
1

Ian Lintag

From: Stacey Turner

Sent: Tuesday, 11 January 2022 3:08 PM

To: Ian Lintag

Subject: FW: Reinstatement Estimate - RED ENERGY CREATIVE PTY LTD

Attachments: ASIC Payment Slip - Red Energy Creative Pty Ltd.pdf; ASIC Reinstatement - Red 

Energy Creative Pty Ltd.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

 

 

Kind Regards,  

Stacey  

 
 

 

 

Stacey Turner 
Client Services Coordinator 

phone: +61 8 8211 9426 

mobile: +61 416 590 800 

email: stacey@ttoca.com.au 

234 Sturt Street ADELAIDE SA 5000 

PO Box 10243 ADELAIDE BC SA 5000 

  ttoca.com.au 
 

Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards Legislation Confidentiality.  

TTO Finance (SA) Pty Ltd is a credit representative (521 702) of BLSSA Pty Ltd A.C.N 117 651 760 (Australian Credit Licence 391 237) 

TTO Midsec Pty Ltd ATF TTO Midsec Wealth is an Authorised Representative of Midsec Licencing Pty Ltd ABN 82 641 436 768 AFSL 524124 

This e-mail is from tto. Chartered Accountants. The contents are intended only for the named recipient of this e-mail. If 

the reader of this e-mail is not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any use, reproduction, disclosure or 

distribution of the information contained in the e-mail is prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please reply 

to us immediately and delete the document from your system. Any personal views expressed in this communication are 

those of the individual sender unless the sender expressly states them to be the views of tto. Chartered Accountants. 

No liability will be accepted for any loss or damage whatsoever (whether direct or consequential) resulting from the use 

of the email or any attached files. 

 

 

From: Stacey Turner  

Sent: Tuesday, 8 September 2020 10:55 AM 

To: 'Mark Pitt' <mark@actioncat.com.au> 

Cc: Yvette Carver <Yvette@ttoca.com.au> 

Subject: RE: Reinstatement Estimate - RED ENERGY CREATIVE PTY LTD 

 
Hi Mark, 

 

Please see attached ASIC Reinstatement form for Red Energy Creative. 

 

Could you please print, sign and attach the supporting documents to the form and post to ASIC (address below) at 

your earliest convenience. Please note ASIC require an original signature for this document. 
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Australian Securities and Investments Comission 

PO Box 4000 

Gippsland Mail Centre VIC 3841 

 

Also, attached is a copy of the ASIC payment details – payment is due upon lodgement of the form. 

 

If you have any queries, please do not hesitate to contact me at the office.  

 

Kind Regards,  

Stacey  

 
 

 

 

Stacey Turner 
Client Services Coordinator 

phone: +61 8 8211 9426 

mobile: +61 416 590 800 

email: stacey@ttoca.com.au 

234 Sturt Street ADELAIDE SA 5000 

PO Box 10243 ADELAIDE BC SA 5000 

  ttoca.com.au 
 

Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards Legislation Confidentiality.  

TTO Finance (SA) Pty Ltd is a credit representative (521 702) of BLSSA Pty Ltd A.C.N 117 651 760 (Australian Credit Licence 391 237) 

TTO Midsec Pty Ltd ATF TTO Midsec Wealth is an Authorised Representative of Lonsdale Financial Group Limited ABN 76 006 637 225 AFSL 246934

This e-mail is from tto. Chartered Accountants. The contents are intended only for the named recipient of this e-mail. If 

the reader of this e-mail is not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any use, reproduction, disclosure or 

distribution of the information contained in the e-mail is prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please reply 

to us immediately and delete the document from your system. Any personal views expressed in this communication are 

those of the individual sender unless the sender expressly states them to be the views of tto. Chartered Accountants. 

No liability will be accepted for any loss or damage whatsoever (whether direct or consequential) resulting from the use 

of the email or any attached files. 

 

 

From: Mark Pitt <mark@actioncat.com.au>  

Sent: Saturday, 5 September 2020 5:57 AM 

To: Yvette Carver <Yvette@ttoca.com.au>; Stacey Turner <Stacey@ttoca.com.au> 

Subject: Fwd: Reinstatement Estimate - RED ENERGY CREATIVE PTY LTD 

 
Hi Yvette, 
 
Here's the ASIC email. 
 
Regards, 
Mark 
 
Sent from my iPad 
 
Begin forwarded message: 

From: <ASIC.No.Reply.Reinstatement.Estimate@asic.gov.au> 
Date: 4 September 2020 at 8:53:28 AM AEST 
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To: <mark@actioncat.com.au> 

Subject: Reinstatement Estimate - RED ENERGY CREATIVE PTY LTD 

 
Please do not reply to this email as the email box is unattended. If you have any queries 

relating to this email direct your query to ASIC's online enquiry service: 

www.asic.gov.au/question. 
 
Dear MARK PITT 
 

Requirements for reinstatement of registration of a company 
 
RED ENERGY CREATIVE PTY LTD (Deregistered) 
 
ACN 003 950 543 
 
Thank you for your request for an estimate of fees due and payable required for an 
application to ASIC for the reinstatement of your company. 
 
Please find below the Reinstatement Estimate, which provides details of the fees payable 
based on the company's Annual Review fees since deregistration, previous amounts owing to 
us at the time the company was deregistered, and the application fee. Methods of payment 
details are also attached. 
 
If you are eligible to apply to ASIC for the reinstatement of your company, you must 
complete the Form 581 Application for ASIC reinstatement which includes the requirement 
to:  
   - provide supporting documentation (where applicable);and  
   - pay in full all fees due and payable as per the estimate obtained. 
 
Post the completed Form 581 (must contain an original signature), together with 
supporting documents and payment for fees, to: 
 
Reinstatement Applications  
Australian Securities & Investments Commission  
PO Box 4000  
Gippsland Mail Centre  
VIC 3841 
 
A copy of the Form 581 Application for ASIC reinstatement is included in this email. 
 
If you require any further assistance or information, refer to our website at 
www.asic.gov.au/reinstatement, telephone ASIC on 1300 300 630, or seek your own 
professional advice from your agent, accountant or lawyer. 
 
Yours Sincerely 
 
Margaret Boothman  
Senior Manager Registry Services  
Registry 
 
 
 

__________________________________________________  

Reinstatement Estimate 



4

 
Company name:      RED ENERGY CREATIVE PTY LTD  
ACN:           003 950 543  
Company Type:      Proprietary  
Date Deregistered:     3/08/2015  
Deregistration Reason:  ASIC Initiated  
Next review date:     09/03/2021 
 

Fees Applicable 

 

Application Fee               $42.00  

Amount owing at time of deregistration   $852.00 

 

Further Review Fees Payable 

 

  Year    Value 
 
  2016  -    $246.00  
  2017  -    $249.00  
  2018  -    $254.00  
  2019  -    $263.00  
  2020  -    $267.00  

 

 

Amount in credit              $  

__________________________________________________  

TOTAL Payable               $2173.00*  

__________________________________________________  

* If your review date has passed since this estimate was created, an additional review 

fee will apply 

 

Methods of Payment  

� Bpay/Post billpay 
 
To avoid unnecessary delay in the processing of your application, click the link below to 
payment details on asic.gov.au 
 
https://connectonline.asic.gov.au/RegistrySearch/faces/bPayPostBillPayDetailSearch.jspx?ad
f.tfDoc=%2Ftaskflows%2FbPayPostBillPayDetailSearch.xml&searchOrgNumber=3950543 
  

Please consider the environment before printing this document. 

   
Information collected by ASIC may contain personal information. Please refer to our Privacy Policy for 
information about how we handle your personal information, your rights to seek access to and correct 
your personal information, and how to complain about breaches of your privacy by ASIC. 

   
This e-mail and any attachments are intended for the addressee(s) only and may be confidential. 
They may contain legally privileged, copyright material or personal and /or confidential information. 
You should not read, copy, use or disclose the content without authorisation. If you have received this 
email in error, please notify the sender as soon as possible, delete the email and destroy any copies. 
This notice should not be removed. 


