AC Chartered Accountants

From: Ann & Bram Denboer <annbram@westnet.com.au>
Sent: Thursday, 16 December 2021 1:25 PM

To: AC Chartered Accountants

Subject: FW: McIntosh Super Fund - 30 June 2021
Attachments: Loan agreement between DH and MSF.pdf

Andy,

Please advise Tony that there is no connection as a related party to this fund, hope this now satisfies Tony,
thanks, Bram

From: Glenn MclIntosh <gmcintosh@outlook.com.au>

Sent: Thursday, 16 December 2021 12:43 PM

To: AC Chartered Accountants <Andy@ACCharteredAccountants.com.au>
Cc: Ann & Bram Denboer <annbram@westnet.com.au>

Subject: RE: MciIntosh Super Fund - 30 June 2021

Hi Andy,
Please see attached the loan agreement between Denboer Holdings Pty Ltd and McIntosh Superannuation.

Regards,
Glenn

From: AC Chartered Accountants <Andy@ACCharteredAccountants.com.au>
Sent: Friday, 10 December 2021 9:59 AM

To: annbram@westnet.com.au

Subject: Mcintosh Super Fund - 30 June 2021

Hi Bram

Tony Boys has come back to me with a query with the Mcintosh SMSF: -

In respect to loans made by the fund to Denboer Holdings Pty Ltd, we seek copy of loan
agreement depicting the agreed terms and repayment schedule. Please also advise if
the borrower is a related party.

09/12/2021

Can you email me the usual letter!!

Regards,

I,

ANDY COLEMAN
Chartered Accountant & Tax Agent



Registered Company Auditor
Self Managed Superannuation Fund Auditor
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